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Freedom of Information Act 2000 — Request Reference Fol/24/289
Welsh Gender Service

1. Details (i.e. the name and date of death of the deceased) of all inquests in relation to which the
Welsh Gender Service has been sent a report under regulation 28 of the Coroners (Investigations)
Regulations 2013 - whether it was a named recipient, or just copied - in relation to someone who
died while on the Welsh Gender Service’s waiting list, from 1 April 2017 to present.

The Welsh Gender Service of Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) has not been named in, or
copied to, any inquests for people who have died while on its waiting list.

2. The number of patients who have been removed from the Welsh Gender Service waiting list
because they have died (by any cause) since 1 April 2017.

There have been six deaths since 1 April 2017 of patients waiting on outpatient lists owned by Gender
Services.

3. All analytical products, slide decks or papers addressing the issue of suicide by people in the care
of, or on the waiting list for, the Welsh Gender Service.

The UHB does not hold this information.

4. Any operational plans produced by the Welsh Gender Service concerning the risk of suicide by
people in the care of, or on the waiting list for, the Sussex Gender Service.

The UHB does not hold this information.
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