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Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Request Reference FoI/24/376 
Continuing Healthcare 

 
I write requesting the following information: 
 
1. Who is responsible for the delivery of Continuing Health Care and what are their contact details 

(name, email and phone number)? 
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. Continuing healthcare is 
led by social services and relevant local authorities. 
 
2. Who is the Personalised Care or Personalisation Lead/Personalised Care Operations Lead at the LHB 

and what are their contact details ((name, email and phone number)? 
 
After considering your request, the UHB believes that the data requested is classed as personal data as 
defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018. Its disclosure 
would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute unfair and unlawful processing with 
regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of the GDPR. We are therefore withholding this detail under section 40(2) of 
the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA). This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no 
requirement to apply the public interest test. 
 
3. Who is the Integrated Care Lead at the LHB and what are their contact details (name, email and 

phone number)? 
 
The UHB believes the exemption as outlined in section 40 of the FOIA applies here and is therefore 
withholding this detail. 
 
4. Who is responsible for the digital transformation within the LHB and what are their contact details 

(name, email and phone number)? 
 
The Director of Digital Transformation is Angela Parratt. However, the UHB believes the exemption as 
outlined in section 40 of the FOIA applies in respect of contact details and is therefore withholding this 
information. 
 
5. Who is the current Director of Finance within the LHB and what are their contact details (name, 

email and phone number)? 
 
After considering your request, the UHB believes that section 21 of the FOIA applies in this instance and is 
refusing your request. A public authority does not have to respond to a request if the information being 
sought is reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means. Under our obligation to advise and assist 
pursuant to section 16 of the FOIA, I can confirm that the relevant information can be found here.  
 
However, in respect of your request for the Director’s email and phone number, the UHB believes the 
exemption as outlined in section 40 of the FOIA applies and is therefore withholding this detail. 

 

https://cavuhb.nhs.wales/about-us/our-board/our-board-members/
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6. How many people, including children, in your LHB  have been awarded Continuing Health Care  in 
the most recent completed financial year (23/24) and how many of these have taken up a 
Independent User Trust option ? 

 
The UHB does not hold this information. Please refer to the following link which you may find of use: 
Welsh Government – Freedom of Information. 

https://www.gov.wales/requesting-information-welsh-government-html

