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Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Request Reference FoI/24/052 
Framework Agencies 

 
1. From 1st January 2023 to 31th December 2023 how many shifts has your Trust/Health Board 

used OFF-Frameworks agencies for? 
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. 
 

2. Within this timeframe please list the number of shifts by ward or department that they were 
utilised in. 

 
As above, the UHB does not hold information relating to the number of shifts. However, the UHB currently 
has two specialist care packages covered specifically by off-framework suppliers. 
 

3. Within this same time frame please state OFF-Framework agency spend Nurses ONLY. 
 
Expenditure for Off-Framework Agency Nurses from 1 January 2023 to 31 December 2023 was £1,472,345. 
 

4. Please list any suppliers with a general Band 5 day charge rate of over £55 per hour that were 
been booked for the Trust in this time period (1/1/23- 31/12/23) 

 
None. 
 

5. Who is responsible for managing the recruitment of temporary staff and what is their work email 
address 

 
After considering your request, Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) believes that the data 
requested is classed as personal data as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and 
Data Protection Act 2018. Its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute 
unfair and unlawful processing with regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of the GDPR. We are therefore 
withholding this detail under section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exemption is 
absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test. 

 


