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Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Request Reference FoI/23/613 
Weight Management Services 

Information Requested: 
 

1. The number of patients in your health board on the waiting list for Tier 3 and Tier 4 weight 
management services 
 

2. The longest and average wait times for patients in your health board to access Tier 3 and Tier 4 
weight management services 

 
3. The number of patients in your health board on the waiting list for weight management surgery 

 
4. The longest and average waiting list times for patients in your health board to recieve weight 

management surgery 
 
Response Details: 
 
In response to question 1: 
 
There were 153 patients waiting for Tier 3 services as at October 2023.  
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (CAVUHB) does not hold information on Tier 4 services as these 
are a tertiary-funded service offered through Swansea Bay University Health Board (SBUHB). 
 
In response to question 2: 
 
The longest wait for Tier 3 services was 37 weeks as at October 2023. CAVUHB does not hold information 
on average wait times. 
 
CAVUHB does not hold information on Tier 4 services. 
 
In response to questions 3 and 4: 
 
CAVUHB does not hold this information. As this service is offered via SBUHB, please refer to the following 
link which you might find of use: SBUHB – Freedom of Information. 

 

https://sbuhb.nhs.wales/about-us/foia/

