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Cardiff and Vale University Health Board is the operational name of Cardiff and Vale University Local Health Board 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/23/245 
Homecare Provider 

 
We ask you to provide the information described below, including the prices paid to independent and 
voluntary sector Homecare Providers for the provision of regulated Homecare services delivered to 
people aged 65 years and over in their own home during the seven-day Reference Period which includes 
Monday, 17 April 2023. 
 
Your attention is drawn to the definitions and interpretation described in sections 2 and 3. 
 
The information requested is: 
 

(a) The lowest rate per hour paid to any individual Homecare Provider during the Reference Period, 
expressed in pounds and pence per hour. 

£17.25 
 

(b) The highest rate per hour paid to any individual Homecare Provider during the Reference Period, 
expressed in pounds and pence per hour. 

£30.00 
 

(c) The average (“arithmetic mean”) price per hour paid to all Homecare Providers for all hours of 
Homecare services purchased during the Reference Period, expressed in pounds and pence per 
hour. 

£22.54 
 

(d) The total hours of Homecare purchased from all Homecare Providers during the Reference 
Period. 

1,418 
 

(e) The total hours of Homecare purchased from all Homecare Providers during a seven-day period 
which includes Monday, 18 April 2022 (i.e. the figure which provides a like-for-like comparison 
with item (d), above, for the previous year). 

1,065 
 

(f) Your organisation’s total spend on Homecare services purchased from all Homecare Providers 
during the Reference Period. 

£36,739 
 

(g)  The total number of Care Packages handed back by all Homecare Providers between Friday, 1 
April 2022 and Friday, 31 March 2023. 

 
The UHB does not hold this information, under our Section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and 
assistance I can advise that the Local Authority may be able to assist you. The following links may be of use 
to you: 
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Freedom of Information (cardiff.gov.uk) 
Requests for Information (valeofglamorgan.gov.uk) 
 

(h)The total number of Care Packages handed back by all Homecare Providers between Thursday, 1 
April 2021 and Thursday, 31 March 2022 (i.e. the figure which provides a like-for-like comparison 
with item (g), above, for the previous year). 

 
The UHB does not hold this information, under our Section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and 
assistance I can advise that the Local Authority may be able to assist you. The following links may be of use 
to you: 

 
Freedom of Information (cardiff.gov.uk) 
Requests for Information (valeofglamorgan.gov.uk) 

 
Questions (a)-(h) refer to Homecare services exclusively. The following questions (i) and (j) relate to all 
social care services, including Homecare services. 
 

(i) The total number of people aged 65 years and over who were awaiting assessment, 
review or the start of a care service on Monday, 17 April 2023 (or on a date as close to this 
as possible). 

 
The UHB does not hold this information, under our Section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and 
assistance I can advise that the Local Authority may be able to assist you. The following links may be of use 
to you: 
 
Freedom of Information (cardiff.gov.uk) 
Requests for Information (valeofglamorgan.gov.uk) 
 

(j)  The total number of people aged 65 years and over who were awaiting assessment, review or 
the start of a care service on Monday, 18 April 2022 (or on a date as close to this as possible) (i.e. 
the figure which provides a like-for-like comparison with item (i), above, for the previous year). 

 
The UHB does not hold this information, under our Section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and 
assistance I can advise that the Local Authority may be able to assist you. The following links may be of use 
to you: 
 
Freedom of Information (cardiff.gov.uk) 
Requests for Information (valeofglamorgan.gov.uk) 
 
 

https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-information/Pages/default.aspx#:~:text=You%20can%20make%20a%20Freedom%20of%20Information%20request,%E2%80%8B%20Information%20Governance%20County%20Hall%20Cardiff%20CF10%204UW
https://www.valeofglamorgan.gov.uk/en/our_council/freedom_of_information/Requests-for-Information.aspx
https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-information/Pages/default.aspx#:~:text=You%20can%20make%20a%20Freedom%20of%20Information%20request,%E2%80%8B%20Information%20Governance%20County%20Hall%20Cardiff%20CF10%204UW
https://www.valeofglamorgan.gov.uk/en/our_council/freedom_of_information/Requests-for-Information.aspx
https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-information/Pages/default.aspx#:~:text=You%20can%20make%20a%20Freedom%20of%20Information%20request,%E2%80%8B%20Information%20Governance%20County%20Hall%20Cardiff%20CF10%204UW
https://www.valeofglamorgan.gov.uk/en/our_council/freedom_of_information/Requests-for-Information.aspx
https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-information/Pages/default.aspx#:~:text=You%20can%20make%20a%20Freedom%20of%20Information%20request,%E2%80%8B%20Information%20Governance%20County%20Hall%20Cardiff%20CF10%204UW
https://www.valeofglamorgan.gov.uk/en/our_council/freedom_of_information/Requests-for-Information.aspx

