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Freedom of Information Act 2000 — Request Reference Fol/23/641
Staff Names and Contact Details

Information Requested:
Please may you provide me with:
The name and best contact details for your:

e Chief People Officer

e Director of HR

e Head of Recruitment or International Recruitment Lead
e Director or Head of Procurement

Or whoever would be the primary contact responsible for the recruitment of overseas Doctors, Nurses,
Allied Health professionals or general clinical staffing professionals.

Please provide the following where available.

1. Contact name
2. Contact’s personal email address
3. Best contact number (direct dial)

Response Details:
e Director or Head of Procurement

After considering your request for the name of Cardiff and Vale University Health Board’s (the UHB's)
Director or Head of Procurement, the UHB believes that section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000
applies in this instance and is refusing your request.

Under section 21 of the Act, a public authority does not have to respond to a request if the information
being sought is reasonably accessible to the applicant by other means. The UHB has applied this exemption
to your request as the information you are seeking is available in the public domain. Under our section 16
obligation to advise and assist, | can confirm that the relevant information can be found via the following
weblink: NWSSP Staff.

e Chief People Officer
e Director of HR
e Head of Recruitment or International Recruitment Lead

The UHB does not hold this information. In accordance with our section 16 duty to provide advice and
assistance, the UHB can confirm that it does not hold posts with these titles. However, please be aware of
relevant information via the following weblink: Our Board Members.
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https://nwssp.nhs.wales/ourservices/procurement-services/about-procurement-services/who-we-are-currently-under-review/frontline-procurement/our-staff-frontline-cardiff-vale/
https://cavuhb.nhs.wales/about-us/our-board/our-board-members/
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After considering your request for staff email addresses and contact details, the UHB believes that the data
requested is classed as personal data as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and
Data Protection Act 2018. Its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute
unfair and unlawful processing with regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of the GDPR. We are therefore
withholding this detail under section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exemption is
absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public interest test.
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