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Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Request Reference FoI/23/645 
Mycoplasma Pneumonia 

Information Requested: 
 

1. The number of cases of Mycoplasma Pneumonia in 2023 compared to the previous years (2019 - 
2023) 

 
2. Please could you further provide a breakdown of the data by age. 

 
3. Since December 2020, please also provide the Covid 19 vaccination status of those diagnosed with 

Mycoplasma Pneumonia. 
 

4. Please also provide the information on children that were below the age of vaccine approval at 
time of diagnosis, and the mother had received a Covid 19 vaccine during pregnancy. 

 
Response Details: 
 
In response to questions 1 and 2: 
 
The below table represents the number of inpatients coded with a diagnosis of Mycoplasma Pneumonia 
(ICD10 J157) split by age on admission, from calendar years 2019–23 (up to and including 27/12/2023). 
 

Age/Year 2019 2020 2023 Summary 

0–9 2 3 0 5 

10–19 1 0 1 2 

20–29 1 2 0 3 

30–39 1 1 0 2 

40–49 1 0 1 2 

50–59 1 0 0 1 

60–69 3 0 0 3 

70–79 0 1 0 1 

80–89 0 2 0 2 

90+ 0 0 0 0 

Summary 10 9 2 21 

 
In response to questions 3 and 4: 
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. In accordance with a 
public authority’s duty to advise and assist under section 16 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the 
UHB can inform you that it does not hold information on all Wales or England vaccination status – only the 
status of individuals vaccinated by the UHB. 

 


