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1. Do you have access to an occupational therapist with skills to teach an amputee how to use a 

myoelectric hand? 
 
Yes.  
 

2. How many amputees do you have who have consistently used a single axis myoelectric hand for the 
past 12 months? 
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. Under Section 16 of 
the FOIA, which provides us with the duty to advise and assist, the UHB can inform you that if it is not a 
‘multi-articulating hand’ i.e. standard myoelectric, then we have approximately 4 users in that 
category. 

 
3. How many unilateral below knee amputees, classified as A2 level mobility, born before 01/10/2004, 

who have attended the clinic or had a job done after 1/10/2020? 
 
The UHB does not hold this information. Under Section 16 of the FOIA, which provides us with the duty 
to advise and assist, the UHB can inform you that the UHB does not record lower limb amputees 
against this classification. 

 
4. How many unilateral above or through knee amputees, classified as A2 level mobility, born before 

1/10/2004, who have attended the clinic or had a job done after 1/10/2020? 
 

Please see above. 
 

 


