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Compliance Rates

1. What were your organisational compliance rates for statutory and mandatory training (separately) in
the following years: 2018,2019,2020,2021 and year to date.
e 30-Sep-2018-73.97%
e 30-Sep-2019-76.74%
e 30-Sep-2020—69.06%
e 30-Sep-2021-67.57%
e 30-Sep-2022 —-73.46%

2. What was your organisational spend on e-learning in the following years: 2018,2019,2020,2021 and
year to date.

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. Under Section 16 of
the FOIA, which provides us with the duty to advise and assist, the UHB can inform you that the UHB
utilise ESR and Learning@Wales e-learning courses.

3. What percentage of your statutory and mandatory training was delivered via e-learning in the
following years: 2018,2019,2020,2021 and year to date.

Year Classroom e-Learning
2018 15.3% 84.7%
2019 14.2% 85.7%
2020 7.1% 92.8%
2021 14.7% 85.0%
2022 6.9% 93.1%

This data covers the 13 modules at level 1 (the 10 CSTF as well as Dementia, Violence Against Women
and Mental Capacity Act).

4. What was your organisational training budget for the following years: 2018,2019,2020,2021 and year
to date.

The UHB does not hold this information. Under Section 16 of the FOIA, which provides us with the duty
to advise and assist, the UHB can inform you that there is no organisational central training budget.
However, there are pockets of funding the UHB access i.e. from HEIW.

5. Who are your suppliers of e-learning training?
¢ Predominantly NWSSP (ESR packages and Learning@Wales)
e Gwella (HEIW)
e LearnPro
e RCNI
e Learn It Online (Clozapine Safety e-learning course)
e Six Steps to Insulin Safety

Bwrdd lechyd Prifysgol Caerdydd a’r Fro yw enw gweithredol Bwrdd lechyd Lleol Prifysgol Caerdydd a’r Fro
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board is the operational name of Cardiff and Vale University Local Health Board Q¢ ABoy, &

VAL
[ _SNBRERE REENIE




