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Cardiff and Vale University Health Board is the operational name of Cardiff and Vale University Local Health Board 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/22/567 
Printers and Fax Machines 

Information Requested: 
 
1. How many printers and fax machines does the health board have at its disposal? 
 

416 Printers currently.  Cardiff and Vale University Health board (the UHB) does not hold the fax 
machine data. 

 
2. What is the total amount spent on printers by the health board? 

 
£336,202.82.  This includes the add-ons and the print charges. (Taken from 21/11/21 – 21/11/22). 

 
3. What is the total amount spent on fax machines by the health board? 

 
The UHB does not hold this information. 

 
4. How many suppliers are considered during a procurement process? 

 
The UHB does not hold this information. Under Section 16 of the FOIA, which provides us with the duty 

to advise and assist, the UHB can inform you Procurement of printing devices are always completed as 

an Open Tender.  This means the number of suppliers can vary. 

 

 


