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Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/22/054
Dental Surgery Wait Times

1. What is the length of time people are having to wait to register onto a waiting list at NHS dental
surgeries that come under the Cardiff and Vale University Health Board? We would like month-by-
month figures for 2021, compared with 2020.

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board does not hold this information. Under our Section 16
obligation to provide advice and assistance, | can inform you that this information is not recorded or
collated.

2. What is the length of time that people are having to wait for routine check-ups at NHS dental
surgeries that come under the Cardiff and Vale University Health Board? We would like month-by-
month figures for 2021, compared with 2020.

Please see above.

3. What is the length of time that people are having to wait for surgery and or operations at NHS
dental surgeries that come under the Cardiff and Vale University Health Board? We would like
month-by-month figures for 2021, compared with 2020.

Please see above.

4. How many dentists left their position at dental surgeries that come under the Cardiff and
Vale University Health Board in 2020 and 2021? And were their roles filled?

Number of GDPs who were removed from dental contracts between 1/4/2019 & 31/3/2020 | 78
Number of GDPs who were added to dental contracts between 1/4/2019 & 31/3/2020 86
Number of GDPs who were removed from dental contracts between 1/4/2020 & 31/3/2021 | 52
Number of GDPs who were added to dental contracts between 1/4/2020 & 31/3/2021 65

5. What is the full capacity of dentists you need within your health board?
The UHB does not hold this information.
6. What is the current number of dentists you have within the health board?

Number of GDPs on dental contracts as of 31/1/2022 — 279

z | .nuullrrnﬁ%i‘l

Bwrdd lechyd Prifysgol Caerdydd a'r Fro yw enw gweithredol Bwrdd lechyd Lleol Prifysgol Caerdydd a’r Fro <& Aoy,
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board is the operational name of Cardiff and Vale University Local Health §‘ ° ."&\i‘ Board
< &

. QQ
075 ABN®



