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Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/22/044 

Long Covid Rehabilitation 
 

Information Requested: 
Hope you are well. I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the 

following information from Cardiff and Vale University Health Board. Please could you provide me 
with?   

  
1. The number of people currently receiving support under Cardiff and Vale University Health 

Board’s Covid-19 rehabilitation model for the long-term effects of coronavirus and persisting 
coronavirus symptoms (also known as ‘long Covid’).  

 
As of February 2022 Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) has  460 actively supported 
by the Long Covid Rehabilitation service.  

 
2. The number of people in total who have received support under Cardiff and Vale University 

Health Board’s Covid-19 rehabilitation model for the long-term effects of coronavirus and 
persisting coronavirus symptoms (also known as ‘long Covid’) since April 2020, broken down by 

month.   
 

The UHB does not hold this information. However, under Section 16 of the FOIA which provides us 
with a duty to provide advice and assistance, I can inform you that the number of referrals from Jan 

2021 – Feb 2022 has fluctuated in line with Covid-19 waves of infection: the lowest referral rate to 
the service being 40 in a month to a peak of 128 in a single month.  

 
3. The number of cases of ‘Long Covid’ reported to Cardiff and Vale University  Health Board by 

GPs/medical professionals since April 2020, broken down by month.   
 

The UHB does not hold this information. Under Section 16 of the FOIA which provides us with a duty 
to provide advice and assistance, I can inform you that this information is not recorded or collated by 
the UHB. 

 
4. The number of cases of ‘Long Covid’ reported to Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (or 

any medical facilities overseen by the board) by members of the public since April 2020, broken 
down by month.  
 

Please see above. 

 


