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Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/22/093 
Children Removed from Parental Care 

Information Requested: 
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I request the following information regarding 
Consultant Paediatrician [Named individual], who works within the Noah’s Ark Children's Hospital, 
UHW 
1. How many cases of child removal from parental care are linked to [Named individual], or linked 

to a multi-disciplinary meeting that [Named individual] attended, where children have 
subsequently been removed from parental care? 
 

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this data. 
 

2. What is [Named individual]’s exact qualifications? 
 

After considering your request, the UHB believes that the data requested is classed as personal data 
as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data Protection Act 2018 and 
its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles and constitute unfair and unlawful 
processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR. We are therefore withholding this detail under 
Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exemption is absolute and therefore 
there is no requirement to apply the public interest test. 
 

3. Where did they gain their qualifications? 
 

Please see above. 
 

4. What CPD has [Named individual] undertaken in the last 5 years? 
 

Please see above. 
 

5. Please send me a copy of the transcript of the GMC investigation in which [Named individual] 
was investigated for their part in the 2004 Roy Meadows case, where 5000 families unethically 
had their children removed from their care, due to the false testimony of [Named individual] 
and colleagues. 
 

The UHB does not hold this information. 
 

6. What exact qualifications enable [Named individual] to call them self a ‘specialist’ in child 
abuse and FII (Munchausen’s by Proxy).  
 

The UHB does not hold this information. 

7. What degree course or postgraduate exam did they take in this specialism, and where did they 
take this? What grade did they get? 
 

The UHB does not hold this information. 

 


