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Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/22/069 
Endometriosis 

 
Information Requested: 
1. Number of GP referrals for endometriosis testing made by male NHS GPs in the past two years. 
 
2. Number of GP referrals for endometriosis testing made by female NHS GPs in the past two years. 
 
3. Number of GP referrals made by male NHS GPs that resulted in an endometriosis diagnosis in the 

past two years. 
 
4. Number of GP referrals made by female NHS GPs that resulted in an endometriosis diagnosis in 

the past two years. 
 
5. Number of conclusive endometriosis diagnoses made by male NHS gynaecologists in the past two 

years. 
 
6. Number of conclusive endometriosis diagnoses made by female NHS gynaecologists in the past 

two years. 
 
Response Details:  
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. Under our Section 
16, obligation to provide advice and assistance, I can Inform you that the UHB does not record or 
collate this information. 

 


