
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/21/429 
Contingency Plans for Schools during Covid-19 

 
Request Details 
 
Could you provide a copy of the written advice that Public Health Wales and Cardiff & Vale 
University Health Board have provided to schools on: 
  
Local outbreaks, i.e.: 
 
1. Updated information on contingency planning and updated contingency framework. 
 

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board does not hold this information. However under 
our Section 16 obligation to provide advice and assistance, I can inform you that this 
would have been provided to schools by Welsh Government and that you can contact 
their Freedom of Information Team by using the below details: 
 
Email:  Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales  
 
Address:  
 
Freedom of Information Officer 
Information Rights Unit 
Welsh Government 
Cathays Park 
Cardiff 
CF10 3NQ 
 

2. The precise criteria that will be used to decide whether schools are ever to close again 
in the future.  
 
Please see answer to Q1. 
 

3. The precise criteria that will be used to decide when schools move a class or year 
group to home learning.  
 
Please see answer to Q1. 
 

4. The actions school should take to reduce the risk of transmission of COVID-19 in their 
setting. 
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board does not hold this information. However under 
our Section 16 obligation to provide advice and assistance, I can inform you that this 
would have been provided to schools by the Local Authority Health and Safety Teams 
and the below contact should be able to help with your request: 
 
Email: FOI@cardiff.gov.uk  

mailto:Freedom.ofinformation@gov.wales
mailto:FOI@cardiff.gov.uk


Address:   
 
Information Governance 
County Hall 
Cardiff 
CF10 4UW 
 

5. Responsibilities of local authorities 
 
Please see answer to Q4. 

 


