Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/21/291
Contraceptive Pill Prescriptions

Request Details
1. How many people in your area have been prescribed the contraceptive pill in the
following years:

o 2016
e 2017
e 2018
e 2019
e 2020
1. How many people in your area have been
prescribed the contraceptive pill in the
following years:
2016 1587
2017 1760
2018 1801
2019 2929
2020 1600

2. How many people in your area have had their prescription to the contraceptive pill
renewed in the same years?

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this data. The UHB
does not record ‘renewed’ pills, only the collective contraceptive pills dispensed.

3. How many people in your area have had a coil fitted in the following years:
e 2018
e 2019
e 2020

3. How many people in your area have had a
coil fitted in the following years:

2018 784
2019 1194
2020 938




How many people in your area have had the contraceptive implant put in over the
following years:

e 2018
e 2019
e 2020

4. How many people in your area have had
the contraceptive implant put in over the
following years:

2018 702
2019 1294
2020 616

How many people in your area have been prescribed or undertaken another form of
contraception over the following years:

e 2018
e 2019
e 2020

5. How many people in your area have been
prescribed or undertaken another form of
contraception over the following years:
2018 832

2019 1346

2020 852




