Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/21/321
ADHD Assessments and Dependence Referrals

Request Details
1. What is the current waiting time for an ADHD assessment for:

a) Children*

*Please note that we are unable to give a waiting time specifically for ADHD assessment
because we assess children for Neurodevelopmental Disorder which includes ADHD and ASD
and do not separate this out until after a child is assessed and given a diagnosis.

b) Adolescents
Please see above.

c) Adults
19 weeks

2. What is the current number of referrals for assessment/treatment of:

a) Alcohol dependence
77 in the last quarter (April —June)

b) Cocaine dependence

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. Under
our section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and assistance, the UHB would like to
inform you this would be treated alongside an opiate or alcohol addiction.

c) Cannabis dependence

Please see the answer for 2b.

d) Problematic gambling

The UHB do not hold this information as this service is not provided by the UHB.



