Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/20/339
CAMHS

Request details

1. Please state the average waiting time between referral of patients aged under 18 and their assessment for the periods: (please provide
your answer in the number of working days)

a) 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018
b) 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019
c) 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020
d) 1 April 2020 to date

2. In the period between 1 April 2020 to 31 August 2020 please can you provide the following information on the total number of
referrals of patients:

a) Received
b) Assessed and not accepted
c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred elsewhere

3. Inthe period between 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020 please can you provide the following information on the total number of
referrals of patients:

a) Received
b) Assessed and not accepted
c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred elsewhere

4. In the period between 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019 please can you provide the following information on the total number of
referrals of patients:



a) Received

b) Assessed and not accepted

c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred elsewhere

5. Inthe period between 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018 please can you provide the following information on the total number of

referrals of patients:

a) Received

b) Assessed and not accepted

c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred elsewhere

Response details

a) 1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018 N/A

b) 1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019 50 Working

c) 1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020 38 Days

d) 1 April 2020 to date 39

1 April 2020 to 31 August 2020 Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec Jan Feb Mar
a) Received 103 140 256 235 212

b) Assessed and not accepted 20 31 66 62 39

c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred
elsewhere

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information.

1 April 2019 and 31 March 2020

Apr

May

Jun

Jul

Aug

Sep

Oct

Nov

Dec

Jan

Feb

Mar

a) Received

317

b) Assessed and not accepted

c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred
elsewhere

323

The UHB does not hold this information.

248

313

191

291

377

303

267

334

330

289

119

96

The UHB does not hold this information.

85

99

98

78




1 April 2018 and 31 March 2019

Apr

May

Jun

Jul

Aug Sep Oct Nov

Dec

Jan

Feb

Mar

a) Received

b) Assessed and not accepted

c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred
elsewhere

296

325

305

316

182 224 345 272
The UHB does not hold this information.

The UHB does not hold this information.

281

300

318

325

1 April 2017 and 31 March 2018

Apr

May

Jun

Jul

Aug Sep Oct Nov

Dec

Jan

Feb

Mar

a) Received

b) Assessed and not accepted

c) Assessed, not accepted, and referred
elsewhere

163

221

254

234

187 203 207 239

The UHB does not hold this information.

The UHB does not hold this information.
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250

288




