Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/20/364
Employment Contracts

Request details

1. Full true copy of the generic (anonymised) contracts of employment (containing
the terms/conditions of employment) issued to NHS employees employed by
C&VUHB and undertaking pre-registration training in clinical psychology;
specifically, contracts issued by C&VUHB in the following years:

2015/16 — Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this
information.

2018/19 - Please find attached

2020/21 - Please find attached (please note the same contract is in place for both these
time periods)

2. Full true copy of the documents (including correspondence) issued by Cardiff
University to C&VUHB stating that NHS employees employed by C&VUHB and
undertaking pre-registration training in clinical psychology are not doing a job of
work and are not in paid employment.

The UHB does not hold this information.

3. Full true copy of the documents (including correspondence) issued by Health
Education England to C&VUHB stating that NHS employees employed by C&VVUHB
and undertaking pre-registration training in clinical psychology are not doing a job
of work and are not in paid employment.

The UHB does not hold this information.

4. Full true copy of the documents (including correspondence) issued by Health
Education and Improvement Wales (HEIW) to C&VUHB stating that NHS
employees employed by C&VUHB and undertaking pre-registration training in
clinical psychology are not doing a job of work and are not in paid employment.

The UHB does not hold this information.
5. Full true copy of the documents (including correspondence) issued by C&VUHB to
Cardiff University informing Cardiff University that NHS employees employed by
C&VUHB and undertaking pre-registration training in clinical psychology are not

doing a job of work and are not in paid employment.

The UHB does not hold this information.



6. Full true copy of the documents created and used by C&VUHB stating that the
Department of Work and Pensions ‘Disability Confident Scheme’ (aka ‘Two Ticks’
Scheme) does not apply to prospective NHS employees (prospective employees of
C&VUHB) seeking employment and pre-registration training with C& VUHB.

The UHB does not hold this information.



