
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/20/109 
Maternal Mortality 

 
Request details 
 
I would like to request the following information about maternal mortality rates under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000: 

1. The number of maternal mortality rates in Wales from 01/01/2015 to the most 
recent data available? 

2. The name of the hospital and local authority (including county and district). Please 
include the latitude and longitude of locations. 

3. The age of the mothers at the time of death 
4. Race and ethnicity of the mothers 
5. If possible: the underlying cause of death.  

Response details 
 
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information.  
 
To comply with our Section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and assistance, please 
follow the link below which you may find useful; 
 
https://www.npeu.ox.ac.uk/mbrrace-uk  
 
The UHB would also like to advise that we do not hold information on an All Wales basis. 
 

 

https://www.npeu.ox.ac.uk/mbrrace-uk

