Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/20/224
Falls

Request details

1. 1 would like to request any data you hold on falls from the last 5 years?
Please refer to the attached spreadsheet.

2. | am looking for the total number of falls sorted by hospital from the last 5 years?
Please refer to the attached spreadsheet.

3. lam looking for the total number of falls sorted by ward from the last 2 years?
Please refer to the attached spreadsheet.

4. 1 would also like to request all email addresses for ward managers and falls
leads/groups within the trust?

After considering your request, the UHB believes that the data requested is classed as
personal data as defined under the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) and Data
Protection Act 2018 and its disclosure would be contrary to the data protection principles
and constitute unfair and unlawful processing in regard to Articles 5, 6, and 9 of GDPR. We
are therefore withholding this detail under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act
2000. This exemption is absolute and therefore there is no requirement to apply the public
interest test.

5. On average how much does falls cost the trust per year?
Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information.

6. Can you also provide the number of patients that absconded from the wards and
which wards were affected for the last 2 years?

Please refer to the attached spreadsheet.

7. How much does each patient on average that absconds from a ward cost the
trust?

The UHB does not hold this information.



