Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference Fol/20/223
Haemonetics Devices

Request details

1. Have there been any additional malfunction incidents with Haemonetics devices in
use in your Trust where particles have been found in plasma? If so, please would
you provide details of the incident, the date it occurred and if the patient who was
connected to the machine was affected in any way as a result of the malfunction

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) have not identified any further incidents
that can be identified now.

2. Have there been any additional malfunction incidents with the Haemonetics
devices in use in your Trust where a loud noise came from the machine whilst it
was in use? If so, please would you provide details of the incident, the date it
occurred and if the patient who was connected to the machine was affected in any
way as a result of the malfunction

The UHB can advise that no further incidents can be identified now.

3. Has there been any other type of malfunction with the devices? Please provide
details of the incident, the date it occurred and if the patient who was connected
to the machine was affected in any way as a result of the malfunction

The UHB can advise that no incident can be identified now.

4. How many patients have Haemonetics’ machines been used on over the last 10
years?

The UHB do not hold this information. To comply with our Section 16 obligation, the duty to
provide advice and assistance, this is estimated as 0 as the devices are no longer used.

5. How many Haemonetics’ machines have been in use over the last 10 years?

The UHB do not hold this information. To comply with our Section 16 obligation, the duty to
provide advice and assistance, this is estimated as 0 as the devices are no longer used.

6. How many of them are still in use?

7. How does the trust use the machines?

Not applicable.



8. What are the names of the machines used?
Not applicable.

9. Do you consider patient lives have been put at risk or treatment unduly delayed as
a result of problems arising with the machines?

Not applicable.



