
Freedom of Information Act 2000 - Request Reference FoI/20/219 
COVID-19 

 
Request details 
 
 
I am sending this request under the Freedom of Information Act to ask for the following 
information: 
 

1) How many covid-19 outbreaks have there been in care homes in your region between 
March 1st and June 16th 2020? 

Cardiff and Vale University Health Board (the UHB) does not hold this information. Under 
our Section 16 obligation, the duty to provide advice and assistance we can advise that 
Cardiff City Council may be able to assist with this question. Please follow the below link for 
further information.  

https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-
information/Pages/default.aspx 

 

2) How many care homes did you provide oxygen to as a result of covid-19 outbreaks 
between: 

a) March 1st to April 15th 

b) April 15th to June 16th 

The UHB does not hold this information 

 

3) How many hospital patients were discharged to care homes between: 

a) March 1st to April 15th 

b) April 15th to June 16th 

Please note the data supplied in respect of question 3b is based on 16th April 2020 to 16th 
June 2020. 

Inpatient 
Admissions 

March 1st to June 
16th 

Total 

COVID Tested 366 366 

Not tested 114 114 

Total  480 480 

https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-information/Pages/default.aspx
https://www.cardiff.gov.uk/ENG/Your-Council/Data-protection-and-FOI/Freedom-of-information/Pages/default.aspx


 COVID Tested status indicates that a COVID test was carried out 
at some point during the Admission but not necessarily at the 
point of Admission/Discharge. 

Admissions from Care Homes in Cardiff and Vale area only. 

 

 

4) How many hospital patients discharged to care homes were tested for covid-19? Please 
give totals for: 

a) March 1st to April 15th 

b) April 15th to June 16th 

Please note the data supplied in respect of question 4b is based on 16th April 2020 to  16th 
June 2020. 

Inpatient 
Discharges 

March 1st to April 
15th 

April 16th to June 
16th 

Total 

COVID Tested 46 148 194 

Not tested 198 15 213 

Total  244 163 407 

 COVID Tested status indicates that a COVID test was carried out at some point 
during the Admission but not necessarily at the point of Admission/Discharge. 

Admissions from Care Homes in Cardiff and Vale area only. 
 

 

 

5) How many of the test results in Q4 were: 

a) positive 

b) negative  

c) inconclusive/ void 

The UHB does not hold this information, we are not able to accurately identify this data with 
the information available to us. 

 

6) How many of the hospital patients discharged to care homes who tested positive for 
covid-19 were asymptomatic? 



The UHB does not hold this information 

 

7) How many covid-19 related ambulance call-out requests did you receive from care 
homes between: 

a) March 1st to April 15th 

b) April 15th to June 16th 

The UHB does not hold this information 

 

8) How many of the call-out requests referred to in Q6 did you send an ambulance to 
between: 

a) March 1st to April 15th 

b) April 15th to June 16th 

The UHB does not hold this information 

 

9) How many care home residents did you admit to hospital between March 1st to June 
16th. Please give totals for: 

 

a) Those with suspected or confirmed covid-19 

b) Non-covid-19 related patients 

Please refer to the ‘Admissions’ tab on the attached spreadsheet 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 


